
 

 

Place FC around two corners of  
the component. FC will bend 
slightly at the “horseshoe” tab.  
Note the direction of  air flow 
when placing your HS.

Press opposite end of  the FC 
down until it is secure around 
the component’s edges.  

To ensure a secure fit, push 
spread apart FC slightly at the 
“horseshoe” tabs while press-
ing down. 

Place HS over the installed FC 
so that the “horseshoe” tabs 
of  the FC fit within the HS’ 
notches. 

Place spring clip within the HS’ 
fin field as shown. The ends of  
the SC will fit over the “horse-
shoe” tabs. 

Push opposite end of  the SC 
down over the FC with a small 
screwdriver until it fits securely 
on the assembly.

Shown above the is the HS, 
FC and SC assembly properly 
seated over the component. 

To remove, place a small flat-
head screwdriver between the 
spring clip and the frame clip 
and pry the spring clip away 
from the frame. 

Remove the FC  by placing a 
small screwdriver  within the 
“horseshoe” tab and gently 
twisting  in either direction to 
pull the frame clip away from 
the component.  
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